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Dear Editor,
Medico-Legal	Update
medicolegalupdate@gmail.com
 
 
I am pleased to submit an original research article entitled “Smoking Behavior among Female
Worker in Indonesia: Does education matter?” by Nikmatur Rohmah et al. for consideration to be
published in the Medico-Legal	Update. In this manuscript, we show that the education level was a
predictor of smoking behavior among female workers in Indonesia. The higher the education
level, the lower the possibility of female workers becoming smokers. We believe that this manuscript
is appropriate for publication by the Medico-Legal	Update because it suits the purpose of providing a
platform for publication of scientific articles in the areas of medical research.
 
This manuscript has not been published and is not under consideration for publication elsewhere. We
have no conflicts of interest to disclose.
 
Thank you for your consideration!
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Corresponding author
 
 
 
Dr. Nikmatur Rohmah
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Please quote reference number. Email us the proof of deposit.( scan copy or photograph of the slip of
bank transfer)
Your acceptance letter would be sent after receipt of charges. 
After this no further amendment will be entertained in the manuscript
Note for authors - Please note that your submission is final and no further amendments would be
accepted in manuscript a�er issue of acceptance le�er. You are hereby advised again to check
manuscript. Re submit file if correc�ons are there. New acceptance le�er would not be issued to
change in authors sequence or affilia�on
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Prof R K Sharma
Editor, Medico-Legal Update
Former Head, Department of Forensic Medicine, A I I M S, New Delhi
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2. Proof of payment
 
Thank you
Nikmatur Rohmah      

2 lampiran

Smoking Behavior among Female Worker in Indonesia_revised references.docx
70K

1. proof payment medicolegal update (Rohmah, et al.,)_organized.pdf
738K

Medico-Legal Update <medicolegalupdate@gmail.com> 8 September 2020 pukul 14.57
Kepada: nikmatur rohmah <nikmaturrohmah@unmuhjember.ac.id>

Find enclose soft copy of acceptance letter as attachment. 
With warm regards
Yours sincerely

Prof R K Sharma
Editor, Medico-Legal Update
Former Head, Department of Forensic Medicine, A I I M S, New Delhi
http://ijop.net/index.php/mlu/about

Address for Correspondence

Dr R K Sharma
Editor, MLU
Institute of Medico-legal Publications
Institute of Education and Research
Logix Office Tower, Unit No. 1704, Logix City Centre Mall
Sector- 32, Noida - 201 301 (Uttar Pradesh) 
   http://ijop.net/index.php/mlu/about

[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

Nikmatur Rohmah_8 sept 2020.pdf
69K

Medico-Legal Update <medicolegalupdate@gmail.com> 8 September 2020 pukul 17.51
Kepada: nikmatur rohmah <nikmaturrohmah@unmuhjember.ac.id>

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=bc822db753&view=att&th=1746caa6eb5f7293&attid=0.1&disp=attd&realattid=f_ketn3bqa0&safe=1&zw
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=bc822db753&view=att&th=1746caa6eb5f7293&attid=0.2&disp=attd&realattid=f_ketn9gi91&safe=1&zw
http://ijop.net/index.php/mlu/about
http://ijop.net/index.php/mlu/about
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=bc822db753&view=att&th=1746cb8c7de6b79c&attid=0.1&disp=attd&realattid=f_ketnvoh60&safe=1&zw


15/03/2023, 15:15 Email Universitas Muhammadiyah Jember - sending revised manuscripts and proof of payment

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=bc822db753&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-a%3Ar-4400690587733215169&simpl=msg-a%3Ar-440… 2/2

Saved the amended manuscript

With warm regards
Yours sincerely

Prof R K Sharma
Editor, Medico-Legal Update
Former Head, Department of Forensic Medicine, A I I M S, New Delhi
http://ijop.net/index.php/mlu/about

Address for Correspondence

Dr R K Sharma
Editor, MLU
Institute of Medico-legal Publications
Institute of Education and Research
Logix Office Tower, Unit No. 1704, Logix City Centre Mall
Sector- 32, Noida - 201 301 (Uttar Pradesh) 
   http://ijop.net/index.php/mlu/about

On Tue, Sep 8, 2020 at 1:12 PM nikmatur rohmah <nikmaturrohmah@unmuhjember.ac.id> wrote:
[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

http://ijop.net/index.php/mlu/about
http://ijop.net/index.php/mlu/about
mailto:nikmaturrohmah@unmuhjember.ac.id

