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On Sun, Sep 27, 2020 at 1:20 PM Nanang saiful rizal <nanangsaifulrizal@unmunjember ac.id= wrote:

We hereby submit articles from the results of our research. We hope that it can be published in the International Journal of Engineering Research & Technology
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The publication fee will be USS 1250

Best regards
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Thank you for receiving our article with the code: 20307-1JERT.
Muhammadiyah University of Jember,

address: JI. Karimata No.49 Jember.

Phone (0331) 336728 Jember 68121

Dr. Nanang Saiful Rizal

Hp /'Wa. 081 339 169 831
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©On Tue, Oct 20, 2020 at 6:42 PM Nanang saiful rizal <panangsaifulrizal@unmuhjember.ac.id= wrote:
herewith we send 2 pieces of proof of payment, the first 750 USD and the second 40 USD

Pada tanggal Sel, 20 Okt 2020 pukul 04.45 International Research Publication House <irpeditor@gmail. com> menulis:
Dear Dr. Nanang Seiful Rizel
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On Fri, Oct 9, 2020 at 3:42 AM Nanang saiful rizal <nanangsaifulrizal@unmuhjember ac.id> wrote:
To the editor of the journal IJERT
we hereby submit amended articles for publication in the journal IJERT

@
best regards
Nanang SR
.
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Pada tanggal Kam, 8 Okt 2020 pukul 03.57 International Research Publication House <irpeditor@gmail.com= menulis:
Dear Dr. Nanang Saiful Rizal,
Paper Code: 20287-1JERT +
Please resend your Updated article. [# will be sent for quick review again.
best regards
Ram Anand I
On Wed, Oct 7, 2020 at 9:44 AM Nanang saiful rizal <nanangsaifulrizal@unmuhjember ac.id= wrote:
Good, mhn sorry if | resend the revised arficle, is it possible?
Pada tanggal Sel, 6 Okt 2020 pukul 21.11 Nanang saiful rizal =nanangsaifulrizal@unmuhjember ac.id> menulis:
Geod, mhn sory if | resend the revised arficle, is it possible?
Pada tanggal Sen, 5 Okt 2020 pukul 18.11 Intemational Research Publication House <irpeditor@gmail.com> menulis:
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